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Village News: 

     The Village would like to remind 
residents that we are now capable of 
email billing.  In order to sign up you 
will need to email us at 
AvistonUtilities@gmail.com.  The email 
will need to include all information 
pertinent to your water/sewer bill, i.e. 
account number, name on account, 
service address, mailing address (if 
different from service address).  
     Also, if you would like your bill to be 
paid electronically, you may do so by 
filling out paperwork from the Village 
Hall.  Please stop by the office and get a 
form if you desire.  A voided check or 
deposit slip is required also. 
     CodeRed forms are still being 
collected.  This is our new emergency 
warning system.  You can register 
yourself on-line or fill out the paperwork 
and we can input for you.  Even if you 
were notified of emergencies under the 
old system, you need to submit 
information for the new system --- your 
information does not automatically roll 
over. 
TRASH – please put your trash in 
garbage bags and not loose in your cans.  
The trucks have front load bins that the 
trash goes in and when they raise the 
bins over the top of the truck, some of 
the items spill out into the roads, yards, 
etc. (especially on windy days).  Your 
cooperation is appreciated. 
     The Zoning Board is currently 
looking for 2 new members.  Meetings 
are held on the last Tuesday of each 
month at 7:30pm.  If you are interesting 

in joining the Zoning Board, please 
contact the Village Hall at 228-7262. 
 
Aviston Legion starts Queen of Hearts 

Raffle: 

     Aviston American Legion held its 
first Queen of Hearts Raffle for on 
Wednesday, Jan 11.  
    Tickets, which cost $1 each, must be 
purchased by 7:30 p.m. to be included in 
the drawing that night. Tickets can be 
purchased in the Legion Clubroom on 
Tuesdays, Wednesdays and Thursdays 
after 6 p.m. and on Fridays and 
Saturdays after 4 p.m.  
    The drawing will be held at 8 pm 
every Wednesday night.  The clubroom 
is always open to the public. Proceeds 
from the raffle will be used for 
maintenance/upkeep and upgrades to the 
Legion Post. 
 
School News: 

     Aviston Elementary would like 
everyone to be aware of the following:  
Tax referenda for April 4, 2017 – 
Resolution to submit to the voters of the 
District the question of an increase in the 
tax rate for the Education Fund from the 
current maximum of .92 percent upon 
the property of the District as equalized 
and assessed, to the rate of 1.27 percent.  
 
Fire Department Raffle:  

     Early bird winners are Frank Hogg 
and Dale Markus.  Tickets are still 
available!  First regular drawing is at the 
end of January. 
 
US Postal Service:   
     PO Box Customers – it is necessary 
to use your PO Box number in order to 
receive your mail.  You cannot just use 
your physical address.  You can have 
both lines of information as your address 
but if you do not include your PO Box, 



the Post Office cannot guarantee 
delivery.  The Post Office apologizes for 
any inconvenience it may cause you, but 
it is better than the inconvenience of a 
bill, letter, or other item getting returned 
due to an incorrect address. 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 

Aviston Zoning Board 
2017 Meeting Schedule 

 
Tuesday, January 31st  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, February 27th 7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, March 28th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, April 25th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, May 30th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, June 27th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, July 25th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, August 29th  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, September 26th 7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, October 31st  7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, November 28th 7:30 p.m. 
Tuesday, December 26th 7:30 p.m. 


